
PET PARTNERS

Website: petpartners.org

Email: contact form on website

Phone: 425-579-5000

BELVUE, WA

TOTAL COST FOR 3 YEARS: $240-275

Handler class (35-local, 70-online), eval 20, 
regis 95 (inc ID badge) for 1st yr and renewal
every 2 yrs is 90 (inc eval). Senior & military 
discount is $20 off regis renewal. Optional 
vest is $33.

EVAL:  every 2 years

Licensed evaluators test for skills and 
aptitude. Information can be found on our 
website. We schedule local evals 3X a year.

VET: complete animal screening form with 
1st and at renewals.

OTHER: handler class must be taken prior to
1st eval – complete background check after 
app is accepted – photo for badge required

INS:  $2 million liability                                      

LOVE ON A LEASH

Website:  loveonaleash.org

Email:  info@loveonaleash.org

Phone:  760-740-2326

OCEANSIDE, CA

TOTAL COST FOR 3 YEARS: $130

Eval 20, regis 50 (inc vest & photo ID badge)
+ 30 renewal each year

EVAL: lifetime – only one evaluation

Control eval (similar to CGC eval), 10 hours 
of supervised visits and final eval with 
approved LOAL evaluator

VET: handler is responsible for keeping 
vaccinations current every year and 
reporting those to all facilities visited

OTHER: photos of dog & handler are 
required for ID badges

Annual renewal form asks handler to review
requirements, confirm & sign

INS:  $1 million liability                       

ALLIANCE of THERAPY DOGS

Website:  Therapydogs.com

Email:  office@therapydogs.com

Phone:  307-432-0272

CHEYENNE, WY

TOTAL COST FOR 3 YEARS: $120

Eval (no charge), bkgrd 20, regis 40 + 30 
renewal each year

EVAL: lifetime – only one evaluation

Done by an ATD approved evaluator + 3 
supervised visits (2 medical)

VET: health verification form showing rabies
and other vaccinations + negative fecal 

OTHER: require wearing red ATD heart on 
dog’s collar and carry member card

Signed annual review and renewal – see 
member guidelines for more info

INS: $5 million liability (when volunteering) 
– option to purchase personal liability 
insurance if your dog comes to work with 
you for $200/yr
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